

**RRWRD Bid #19-215
Annual Polymer Supply
Bid Tabulation**

Vendor	City, State	Product	Polymer Cost/Lb.			Performance Cost/Dry Ton		
			12 mo. Supply	24 mo. Supply	36 mo. Supply	12 mo. Supply	24 mo. Supply	36 mo. Supply
Polydyne	Riceboro, GA	2030	\$1.07	\$1.07	\$1.07	\$109.90	\$109.90	\$109.90
Polydyne	Riceboro, GA	2129	\$1.07	\$1.07	\$1.07	\$86.25	\$86.25	\$86.25
Polydyne	Riceboro, GA	2130	\$1.07	\$1.07	\$1.07	\$78.06	\$78.06	\$78.06
Solenis/Midwest CE	Wilmington, DE	8849	\$1.06	no bid	no bid	\$99.21	no bid	no bid